UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
NORTHERN DISTRICT OF WEST VIRGINIA
Clarksburg DIVISION

In re: Robert Guy Sigley, JR.
Tamara June Sigley

§ Case No. 18-00482
§
§
§

Debtor(s)

TRUSTEE'S FINAL REPORT (TFR)
The undersigned trustee hereby makes this Final Report and states as follows:

1. A petition under Chapter 7 of the United States Bankruptcy Code was filed on 05/18/2018. The
undersigned trustee was appointed on 05/18/2018.

2. The trustee faithfully and properly fulfilled the duties enumerated in 11 U.S.C. §704.

3. All scheduled and known assets of the estate have been reduced to cash, released to the debtor as
exempt property pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 522, or have been or will be abandoned pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 554,
An individual estate property record and report showing the disposition of all property of the estate is attached
as Exhibit A.

4. The trustee realized the gross receipts of $ 287,500.00

Funds were disbursed in the following amounts:

Payments made under an

interim distribution 0.00
Administrative expenses 0.00
Bank service fees 0.00
Other payments to creditors 0.00
Non-estate funds paid to 3rd Parties 0.00
Exemptions paid to the debtor 0.00
Other payments to the debtor 0.00
Leaving a balance on hand of’ $ 287.500.00

The remaining funds are available for distribution.

"The balance of funds on hand in the estate may continue to earn interest until disbursed. The interest earned prior to
disbursement will be distributed pro rata to creditors within each priority category. The trustee may receive additional
compensation not to exceed the maximum compensation set forth under 11 U.S.C. § 326(a) on account of the disbursement
of the additional interest.
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5. Attached as Exhibit B is a cash receipts and disbursements record for each estate bank account.

6. The deadline for filing non-governmental claims in this case was 10/18/2018 and the deadline for filing
governmental claims was 10/18/2018. All claims of each class which will receive a distribution have been
examined and any objections to the allowance of claims have been resolved. If applicable, a claims analysis,
explaining why payment on any claim is not being made, is attached as Exhibit C.

7. The Trustee's proposed distribution is attached as Exhibit D.

8. Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 326(a), the maximum compensation allowable to the trustee is $10,084.08. To
the extent that additional interest is earned before case closing, the maximum compensation may increase.

The trustee has received $0.00 as interim compensation and now requests the sum of $10,084.08, for a
total compensation of $10,084.082. In addition, the trustee received reimbursement for reasonable and
necessary expenses in the amount of $0.00 and now requests reimbursement for expenses of $129.50 for total
expenses of $129.502,

Pursuant to Fed R Bank P 5009, | hereby certify, under penalty of perjury, that the foregoing report is true
and correct.

Date: 06/23/2025

Trustee

STATEMENT: This Uniform Form is associated with an open bankruptcy case, therefore, Paperwork Reduction
Act exemption 5 C.F.R. §1320.4(a)(2) applies.

2If the estate is administratively insolvent, the dollar amounts reflected in this paragraph may be higher than the
amounts listed in the Trustee's Proposed Distribution (Exhibit D)
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Case No.:
Case Name:

Form 1

Individual Estate Property Record and Report
Asset Cases

18-00482

Robert Guy Sigley, JR.
Tamara June Sigley

Trustee Name:
Date Filed (f) or Converted (c):

(680230) Thomas H. Fluharty
05/18/2018 (f)

Exhibit A
Page: 1

§ 341(a) Meeting Date: 07/11/2018
For Period Ending: 06/23/2025 Claims Bar Date: 10/18/2018
1 2 3 4 5 6
Asset Description Petition/ Estimated Net Value Property Formally Sale/Funds Asset Fully
(Scheduled And Unscheduled (u) Property) Unscheduled (Value Determined By Abandoned Received by the Administered (FA)/
Values Trustee, OA=§554(a) Estate Gross Value of
Less Liens, Exemptions, abandon. Remaining Assets
Ref. # and Other Costs)

1 15 Lower Valley Drive, Reedsville, WV 65,000.00 0.00 0.00 FA

26547-0000

1 acre lot. double wide, grey w/ maroon shutters; 3

bedrooms, 2 baths, living, dining, kitchen, laundry, no

garage, back & front porches.
2 2006 Subaru Outback, 130,000 miles, 1,500.00 0.00 0.00 FA
3 1984 4 Wheeler, 19894, 4 wheeler with a 100.00 0.00 0.00 FA

snow low
4 Bed and mattresses 100.00 0.00 0.00 FA
5 2 dressers and night stand 100.00 0.00 0.00 FA
6 Boom Box 15.00 0.00 0.00 FA
7 Couch 40.00 0.00 0.00 FA
8 Recliner 40.00 0.00 0.00 FA
9 VOID 0.00 0.00 0.00 FA
10 VOID 0.00 0.00 0.00 FA
11 Coffee Table 15.00 0.00 0.00 FA
12 Lamp Stand (little) 20.00 0.00 0.00 FA
13 Table and Chairs 75.00 0.00 0.00 FA
14 Washer 100.00 0.00 0.00 FA
15 Dryer 100.00 0.00 0.00 FA
16 Pots, pans, dishes 20.00 0.00 0.00 FA
17 Coffee Pot 10.00 0.00 0.00 FA
18 Microwave 25.00 0.00 0.00 FA
19 Desk Top Computer 75.00 0.00 0.00 FA
20 TV 42' 100.00 0.00 0.00 FA
21 Galaxy Tablet 50.00 0.00 0.00 FA
22 Husqvarna Lawn Mower 75.00 0.00 0.00 FA
23 Bolen Push Mower 50.00 0.00 0.00 FA
24 HuqvarnaWeed Eater 50.00 0.00 0.00 FA
25 16 Gauge Single Shot Gun 243 Deer 350.00 0.00 0.00 FA

Rifle

High Point 45 caliber pistol
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Form 1

.. Exhibit A
Individual Estate Property Record and Report Page: 2
Asset Cases
Case No.: 18-00482 Trustee Name: (680230) Thomas H. Fluharty
Case Name:  Robert Guy Sigley, JR. Date Filed (f) or Converted (c): 05/18/2018 (f)
Tamara June Sigley X
§ 341(a) Meeting Date: 07/11/2018
For Period Ending: 06/23/2025 Claims Bar Date: 10/18/2018
1 2 3 4 5 6
Asset Description Petition/ Estimated Net Value Property Formally Sale/Funds Asset Fully
(Scheduled And Unscheduled (u) Property) Unscheduled (Value Determined By Abandoned Received by the Administered (FA)/
Values Trustee, OA=§554(a) Estate Gross Value of
Less Liens, Exemptions, abandon. Remaining Assets
Ref. # and Other Costs)
26 Basic Clothing 100.00 0.00 0.00 FA
27 Mother's Wedding Rings, wedding rings, 178.00 0.00 0.00 FA
ring Mother-in-law gave her; cross necklace; birthstone
ear rings; hoop ear rings; necklace.
28 2 dogs both Beagle Mix 10.00 0.00 0.00 FA
29 Cash 59.12 0.00 0.00 FA
30 Checking: Checking WesBanco 200.00 0.00 0.00 FA
Masontown WV
31 Ret. or Pension Acct.: 401K 1,057.61 0.00 0.00 FA
32 Ret. or Pension Acct.: The Pines Country 634.67 0.00 0.00 FA
Club, |
33 2017 Tax Refund: Federal 1,681.00 0.00 0.00 FA
34 Debtor was biten by a dog and is still Unknown 25,000.00 287,500.00 FA
having tr
34 Assets Totals (Excluding unknown values) $71,930.40 $25,000.00 $287,500.00 $0.00
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Form 1
Individual Estate Property Record and Report
Asset Cases

Exhibit A
Page: 3

Case No.: 18-00482 Trustee Name: (680230) Thomas H. Fluharty
Case Name:  Robert Guy Sigley, JR. Date Filed (f) or Converted (c): 05/18/2018 (f)
Tamara June Sigley X
§ 341(a) Meeting Date: 07/11/2018
For Period Ending: 06/23/2025 Claims Bar Date: 10/18/2018

Major Activities Affecting Case Closing:

6-23-25: revised trustee timesheet, draft expense report; draft TFR.

6-20-25: rec'd settlement check / drafted claims distribution

6-9-25: emailed M. Rhodes for update when receive funds.

5-12-25: emailed Macel Rhodes amended order on compromise, when will estate receive funds.

5-7-25: filed amended motion compromise

5-6-25: revised amended motion to compromise

4-25-25:; updated UST on case.

3-24-25: filed app pay sp counsel fees.

3-22-25: revised application.

3-21-25: drafted appl pay sp counsel fees & costs.

3-12-25: V. Hopkins called back, she will contact other atty and have them send funds to THF/ she
will send her fees & expenses.

3-11-25: called V. Hopkins, left message.

1-13-25: called V. Hopkins, left message / she returned call, she will send her costs & fees; does not
have info on the medical lien yet; will have them send the funds to Trustee & Trustee will pay all
fees & liens when they come in. / she will look at debtors exemption and may amend.

12-16-24: filed motion approve settlement

12-11-24: revised motion compromise, sent to Hopkins for review / revised objection claim, filed &
served.

12-10-24: drafted objection claim 10, late filed / revised motion compromise.

11-26-24: complete draft motion compromise

11-21-24: draft motion to comp settlement

7-30-24: letter to class action atty for update on case.

6-25-24: provided UST an update on case.

5-20-24: received copy of scheduling order from atty, reviewed.

4-24-24: called attorney's office for update on case & time of hearing on May 9th, left message

2-1-24: Virginia Hopkins sent update on case. There was a hearing on January 16. Mrs medical condition not

improved, pretrial in civil case set
for May 9th / Mr. has cancer, quite ill.

1-10-23: emailed Atty Hopkins for an update on case.

4-24-23: atty sent documents relating to progress of lawsuit, case still ongoing; debtor still receiving

significant medical treatment & info

regarding her syndrome.

12-22-22: emailed attorney for update on case.

9-27-22: called Hopkins, female debtor treatment about over, some discovery done, depo's on hold until

treatment over, no scheduling order by Judge // will send copies of complaint, discovery.

9-23 & 26-22: called left messages for update on case.

8-30-22: called attorney's office for update, left message.

7-19-22: called attorney's office for update, attorney out w/COVID.

6-8-22: called Virginia Hopkins office, left message.

3-10-22: to Kingwood review file.

2-7-22: emailed attorney for an update.

1-28-22: called attorney for update. Debtor (Mrs) has had her 2nd surgery today, waiting to hear. Attorney

will get update out in next couple
days.

9-8-21: emailed attorney for update on case.

6-30-21: emailed update letter to attorney on progress of lawsuit.

2-3-21: rec'd update, Mrs. Sigley receiving treatment for her injuries, diagnosed w/Complex Regional Pain

Syndrome w/PTSD symptoms. A
variety of treatments are being applied with little success in resolving pain. Needs assistance to walk &

missing work.

2-2-21: emailed attorney for update on lawsuit.

5-11-2020: attn to corresp from atty re: lawsuit has been filed.

3-26-2020: called Virginia Hopkins left message for update. / mailed update letter.

9-2-19: TC - VH case is complicated still proceeding.
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Form 1
Individual Estate Property Record and Report
Asset Cases

Exhibit A
Page: 4

Case No.: 18-00482 Trustee Name: (680230) Thomas H. Fluharty
Case Name:  Robert Guy Sigley, JR. Date Filed (f) or Converted (c): 05/18/2018 (f)
Tamara June Sigley X
§ 341(a) Meeting Date: 07/11/2018
For Period Ending: 06/23/2025 Claims Bar Date: 10/18/2018

7-1-19: TC V. Hopkins. Debtor still being treated by specialists, looks like permanent damage, waiting on
doctors to finish treating and give
detailed analysis.
6-3-19: update letter to attorney on case / review claims docket.
4-5-19: TC - VH re: case.
12-4-18: TC - Virginia H. re: case.
8-13-18: TC - VH debtor suffered serious injury due to neighbor's dog.
Employ Virginia Hopkins to pursue lawsuit.

Initial Projected Date Of Final Report (TFR): 09/30/2019 Current Projected Date Of Final Report (TFR): 06/30/2025

UST Form 101-7-TFR (5/1/2011)



Form 2 Exhibit B
. . Page: 1
Cash Receipts And Disbursements Record
Case No.: 18-00482 Trustee Name: Thomas H. Fluharty (680230)
Case Name: Robert Guy Sigley, JR. Bank Name: TriState Capital Bank
Tamara June Sigley Account #: *xxxx6794 Checking
Taxpayer ID #: Blanket Bond (per case limit): $3,000,000.00
For Period Ending:  06/23/2025 Separate Bond (if applicable):  N/A
1 2 3 4 5 6 7
Trans. Check or Paid To / Received From Description of Transaction Uniform Deposit Disbursement Account Balance
Date Ref. # Tran. Code $ $
06/20/25 {34} Erie Insurance settlement proceeds 1129-000 287,500.00 287,500.00
COLUMN TOTALS 287,500.00 0.00 $287,500.00
Less: Bank Transfers/CDs 0.00 0.00
Subtotal 287,500.00 0.00
Less: Payments to Debtors 0.00
NET Receipts / Disbursements $287,500.00 $0.00

{ } Asset Reference(s)
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Form 2 Exhibit B
Page: 2
Cash Receipts And Disbursements Record
Case No.: 18-00482 Trustee Name: Thomas H. Fluharty (680230)
Case Name: Robert Guy Slg!ey, JR. Bank Name: TriState Capital Bank
Tamara June Sigley
Account #: ***ERx6794 Checking
Taxpayer ID #:
. . Blanket Bond (per case limit): $3,000,000.00
For Period Ending: 06/23/2025
Separate Bond (if applicable): N/A
4 N
Net Receipts: $287,500.00
Plus Gross Adjustments: $0.00
Less Payments to Debtor: $0.00
Less Other Noncompensable Items: $0.00
Net Estate: $287,500.00
. J
NET ACCOUNT
TOTAL - ALL ACCOUNTS NET DEPOSITS __ DISBURSEMENTS BALANCES
***x*6794 Checking $287,500.00 $0.00 $287,500.00
$287,500.00 $0.00 $287,500.00
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TRUSTEE'S PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

Exhibit D
Case No.: 18-00482
Case Name: Robert Guy Sigley, JR. AND
Tamara June Sigley
Trustee Name: Thomas H. Fluharty
Balance on hand: $ 287,500.00
Claims of secured creditors will be paid as follows:
Claim Claimant Claim Allowed Interim Proposed
No. Asserted Amount Payments Payment
of Claim to Date
None
Total to be paid to secured creditors: $ 0.00
Remaining balance: $ 287,500.00
Applications for chapter 7 fees and administrative expenses have been filed as follows:
Reason/Applicant Total Interim Proposed
Requested Payments Payment
to Date
Trustee, Fees - Thomas H. Fluharty, Trustee 10,084.08 0.00 10,084.08
Trustee, Expenses - Thomas H. Fluharty, Trustee 129.50 0.00 129.50
Special Counsel for Trustee Fees - Virginia Jackson Hopkins 94,050.00 0.00 94,050.00
Special Counsel for Trustee Expenses - Virginia Jackson Hopkins 12,163.06 0.00 12,163.06
Total to be paid for chapter 7 administrative expenses: $ 116,426.64
Remaining balance: $ 171,073.36
Applications for prior chapter fees and administrative expenses have been filed as follows:
Reason/Applicant Total Interim Proposed
Requested Payments Payment
None
Total to be paid for prior chapter administrative expenses: $ 0.00
Remaining balance: $ 171,073.36

UST Form 101-7-TFR(5/1/2011)




In addition to the expenses of administration listed above as may be allowed by the Court,
priority claims totaling $0.00 must be paid in advance of any dividend to general (unsecured) creditors.

Allowed priority claims are:

Claim Claimant Allowed Amount Interim Payments Proposed
No. of Claim to Date Payment
None
Total to be paid for priority claims: $ 0.00
Remaining balance: $ 171,073.36

The actual distribution to wage claimants included above, if any, will be the proposed payment
less applicable withholding taxes (which will be remitted to the appropriate taxing authorities).

Timely claims of general (unsecured) creditors totaling $17,370.62 have been allowed and will
be paid pro rata only after all allowed administrative and priority claims have been paid in full. The
timely allowed general (unsecured) dividend is anticipated to be 100.0 percent, plus interest (if
applicable).

Timely allowed general (unsecured) claims are as follows:

Claim Claimant Allowed Amount Interim Payments Proposed
No. of Claim to Date Payment
1 First National Bank of Omaha 1,312.22 0.00 1,312.22
2 U.S. Bank National Association 1,441.35 0.00 1,441.35
3 Synchrony Bank 1,251.00 0.00 1,251.00
4 PYOD, LLC 2,913.71 0.00 2,913.71
5 PYOD, LLC. 1,566.20 0.00 1,566.20
6 PYOD, LLC. 1,284.48 0.00 1,284.48
7 PYOD, LLC 1,730.44 0.00 1,730.44
8 PYOD, LLC 4,081.66 0.00 4,081.66
9 Synchronly Bank 1,789.56 0.00 1,789.56
Total to be paid for timely general unsecured claims: $ 17,370.62
Remaining balance: $ 153,702.74

Tardily filed claims of general (unsecured) creditors totaling $0.00 have been allowed and will be
paid pro rata only after all allowed administrative, priority and timely filed general (unsecured) claims
have been paid in full. The tardily filed claim dividend is anticipated to be 0.0 percent, plus interest (if
applicable).

Tardily filed general (unsecured) claims are as follows:

UST Form 101-7-TFR(5/1/2011)

Claim Claimant Allowed Amount Interim Payments Proposed

No. of Claim to Date Payment

10 Absolute Resolutions 0.00 0.00 0.00
Investments, LLC

Total to be paid for tardily filed general unsecured claims: $ 0.00

Remaining balance: $ 153,702.74




Subordinated unsecured claims for fines, penalties, forfeitures, or damages and claims ordered
subordinated by the Court totaling $0.00 have been allowed and will be paid pro rata only after all
allowed administrative, priority and general (unsecured) claims have been paid in full. The dividend for

subordinated unsecured claims is anticipated to be 0.0 percent, plus interest (if applicable).

Subordinated unsecured claims for fines, penalties, forfeitures or damages and claims ordered

subordinated by the Court are as follows:

Claim Claimant Allowed Amount Interim Payments Proposed
No. of Claim to Date Payment
None
Total to be paid for subordinated claims: 0.00
Remaining balance: 153,702.74

To the extent funds remain after payment in full of all allowed claims, interest will be paid at the
legal rate of 2.27% pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 726(a)(5). Funds available for interest are $2,884.43. The

amounts proposed for payment to each claimant, listed above, shall be increased to include the

applicable interest.

The amount of surplus returned to the debtor after payment of all claims and interest is

$150,818.31.

UST Form 101-7-TFR(5/1/2011)



Printed: 06/23/2025 1.12 PM

Debtor: Robert Guy Sigley, JR.

Tamara June Sigley

Trustee's Compensation

Case: 18-00482

Computation of Compensation

Total disbursements to other than the debtor are: 136,681.69
Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. 326, compensation is computed as follows:
25% of First $5,000 5,000.00 1,250.00
10% of Next $45,000 45,000.00 4,500.00
5% of Next $950,000 86,681.69 4,334.08
3% of Balance 0.00 = 0.00
Calculated Total Compensation: $10,084.08
Adjustment: 0.00
Total Compensation: $10,084.08
Less Previously Paid: 0.00
Total Compensation Requested: $10,084.08
Trustee Expenses
TRAVEL 100.0 TRAV at $0.63 $62.50
TRAVEL 100.0 TRAV at $0.67 $67.00
Subtotal Expenses: $129.50
Plus Adjustment: 0.00
Total Expenses: $129.50
Less Previously Paid: 0.00
Total Expenses Requested: $129.50

The undersigned Trustee certifies under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct to the best
of his/her knowledge and requests the United States Trustee to approve this report and accounts and requests
the Court to provide for notice and opportunity for a hearing under 11 U.S.C. 330(a), 502(b), and 503(b) and to
thereafter award final compensation or reimbursement of expenses and to make final allowance for the
purposes of distribution to claims, administrative expenses, and other payments stated in this report and
account.

WHEREFORE, the Trustee requests that this application be approved by this Court and that the Trustee be granted
an allowance of $10084.08 as compensation and $129.50 for reimbursement of expenses. The Trustee further states
that no payments have been made or promised to him/her for services rendered or to be rendered in any capacity in this
case. No agreement or understanding exists between applicant and any other person for sharing compensation
received or to be received.

Dated: 06/23/2025 Signed:

Thomas H. Fluharty, TRUSTEE
408 Lee Avenue
Clarksburg, WV 26301
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Printed: 06/23/2025 8.00 AM
Trustee Expense
Period: 03/10/2022 - 12/19/2024
Trustee: Thomas H. Fluharty

Page: 1

Case Number: 18-00482 Case Name: ROBERT GUY SIGLEY AND TAMARA
Case Type: Asset Judge: David L. Bissett
Petition Date: 05/18/2018 341a Meeting: 07/11/2018 10.00 AM

Category: TRAV

Date Description Hours/Unit Rate Total
12/19/2024  to & from Kingwood, review file 100.0 $ 0.670000 $67.00
03/10/2022  to & from Kingwood look over file 100.0 $ 0.625000 $62.50

Total for category TRAV 200.0 $129.50
Total for case 18-00482: $129.50

[ Grand Total:

$129.50J




